
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-17053

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase Installation and Disposal of Front Entrance and Exiting

FOR: Dos Rios Water Recycling Center

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 19, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 2 each UNIT

Install two (2) HySecurity DC-10F (2.25tf. Per second) Slide Smart Operators, full chain PRICE 5,500.00 8,475.00 5,160.00 4,842.30 6,859.50 No Bid

1. link fabric with cross supports meet UL 325 compliances. TOTAL 11,000.00 16,950.00 10,320.00 9,684.60 13,719.00

1 each UNIT

Replace, relocate and install one entrance gate Jamieson manufacture slide gates. PRICE 6,900.00 5,975.00 11,880.00 10,474.45 17,350.00 No Bid

2. TOTAL 6,900.00 5,975.00 11,880.00 10,474.45 17,350.00

Item Deleted UNIT

PRICE No Bid

3. TOTAL

1 each UNIT

Replace, relocate and install one exit gate Jamieson manufacture slide gates. PRICE 6,900.00 5,975.00 6,700.00 10,474.45 17,350.00 No Bid

4 TOTAL 6,900.00 5,975.00 6,700.00 10,474.45 17,350.00

 

 No Bid

 TOTAL TOTAL 24,800.00 28,900.00 28,900.00 30,633.50 48,419.00

Net Net Net 2.0% Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days

Delivery Days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Swift Corporation, LLC

 BP Equipment Co. Demandstar Demandstar Demandstar

Construction Rent-A-Force, Inc. SAWS Website SAWS Website SAWS Website

Guido Automatic Gates, Cameras & More

Associated Time & Parking Controls

Total Protection systems, Inc.
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